
	 महाराष्ट्रõ शासन रा असाधारण भाग आठ, ऑक्टोबर १४, २०२४/आश्विन २२, शके १९	 1

TOURISM AND CULTURAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT 

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk, 
 Mumbai 400 032, dated the 14th October 2024. 

MAHARASHTRA ORDINANCE No. X  OF 2024.

AN ORDINANCE        

to amend the Maharashtra Ancient  
Monuments and Archaeological Sites and Remains Act, 1960.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session; 

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra is satisfied that 
circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action 
to amend the Maharashtra Ancient Monuments and Archaeological Sites and 
Remains Act, 1960, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; 

)१(

Mah. 
XII of 
1961.

भाग आठ-७०–१

RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

महाारााष्ट्र शाासन रााजपत्र
असााधाारण भााग आठ

वर्षष १०, अंंक २९] सोोमवाार, ऑक्टोोबर १४, २०२४/आश्वि�िन २२, शकेे १९४६ [पृषृ्ठे 4,  किं�ंमत : रुपयेे २३.००

असााधाारण क्रमांं�क ७०

प्रााधि�कृृत प्रकााशन
महाारााष्ट्र वि�धाानमंंडळााचेे अधि�नि�यम व रााज्यपाालांं�नीी प्रख्याापि�त केेलेेलेे अध्याादेेश व केेलेेलेे  

वि�नि�यम आणि� वि�धि� व न्यााय वि�भाागााकडूून आलेेलीी वि�धेेयकेे (इंंग्रजीी अनुुवााद).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in 
English of the Maharashtra Ancient Monuments and Archaeological Sites and Remains (Amendment) 
Ordinance, 2024 (Mah. Ord. X of 2024), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,    

SATISH WAGHOLE,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

[ Translation in English of the Maharashtra Ancient Monuments and Archaeological Sites and 
Remains (Amendment) Ordinance, 2024, (Mah. Ord. X of 2024) published under the authority of 
the Governor].



2	 महाराष्ट्रõ शासन रा असाधारण भाग आठ, ऑक्टोबर १४, २०२४/आश्विन २२, शके १९	

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of 
article 213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Maharashtra is hereby 
pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance, namely : –

1. ( 1) This Ordinance may be called the Maharashtra Ancient Monuments 
and Archaeological Sites and Remains (Amendment) Ordinance, 2024. 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 

2.  In section 33 of the Maharashtra Ancient Monuments and Archaeological 
Sites and Remains Act, 1960 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”),–- 

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “with imprisonment for a term 
which may extend to three months, or with fine which may extend to five 
thousand rupees” the words “ with imprisonment for a term which may 
extend to two years, or with fine which shall not be less than ten thousand 
rupees but which may extend to one lakh rupees” shall be substituted; 

(2) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, 
namely :–

“(1A) Whoever,– 

(i) consumes or possesses liquor or any intoxicating substance 
in the premises of the protected monuments, or 

(ii) does any obscene act in the premises of the protected 
monuments, or 

(iii) does an act of gambling in the premises of the protected 
monuments, 

shall, on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term 
which may extend to six months, or with fine which may extend 
to one lakh rupees, or with both.”; 

(3) in sub-section (2),–

(a) for the words “with fine which may extend to two thousand 
rupees,” the words “with fine which shall not be less than ten thousand 
rupees but which may extend to one lakh rupees,” shall be substituted; 

(b) for the words “twenty-five rupees” the words “five hundred 
rupees” shall be substituted; 

(4) in sub-section (3), for the words “with fine which may extend to 
five thousand rupees” the words “with fine which shall not be less than 
ten thousand rupees but which may extend to one lakh rupees” shall be 
substituted. 

3.  In section 35 of the principal Act,– 

(1) for the words and figures “Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898” the 
words and figures “Bharatiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” shall be 
substituted; 

(2) for the word “Code” the word “Sanhita” shall be substituted. 

V of  
1898.
46 of 
2023.

Mah. 
XII of 
1961.

Short title and 
commencement.

Amendment 
of section 33 

of Mah. XII of 
1961.

Amendment 
of section 35 

of Mah. XII of 
1961.



	 महाराष्ट्रõ शासन रा असाधारण भाग आठ, ऑक्टोबर १४, २०२४/आश्विन २२, शके १९	 3

4.  In section 36 of the principal Act,–

(1) for the words and figures “section 32 of the Code of Criminal 
Procedure, 1898” the words and figures “section 23 of the Bhartiya 
Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” shall be substituted; 

(2) for the words “two thousand rupees” at both the places where 
they occurs, the words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5.  In section 41 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),–

(1) in clause (i), for the words “with fine which may extend to five 
thousand rupees,” the words “with fine which shall not be less than 
ten thousand rupees, but which may extend to one lakh rupees,” shall 
be substituted;

(2) in clause (ii), for the words “with fine which may extend to five 
thousand rupees” the words “with fine which shall not be less than ten 
thousand rupees, but which may extend to one lakh rupees,” shall be 
substituted;

(3) in clause (iii), for the words “with fine which may extend to 
five hundred rupees” the words “with fine which shall not be less than 
ten thousand rupees, but which may extend to one lakh rupees” shall 
be substituted. 

Amendment 
of section 36 
of Mah. XII of 
1961.

Amendment 
of section 41 
of Mah. XII of 
1961.

V of  
1898.
46 of 

2023.



4	 महाराष्ट्रõ शासन रा असाधारण भाग आठ, ऑक्टोबर १४, २०२४/आश्विन २२, शके १९	

STATEMENT 

The Maharashtra Ancient Monuments and Archaeological Sites and 
Remains Act, 1960 (Mah. XII of 1961) provides for better provisions for the 
preservation of ancient and historical monuments and records and archaeological 
sites and remains (other than those declared to be of national importance) in 
the State of Maharashtra and for matters connected therewith. 

The founder of the Maratha Empire Chhatrapati Shivaji Maharaj had 
constructed various forts. These forts have witnessed the golden history of 
the Maharashtra. The Government of Maharashtra had declared various 
historical forts as the protected monuments under the said Act. Recently, the 
Government of India has submitted proposal to the United Nations Educational, 
Scientific and Cultural Organization (UNESCO) to nominate “Maratha Military 
Landscape” as the World Heritage, including four forts, which has declared as 
protected monuments under the said Act. 

2.  Section 33 of the said Act provides for the penalties for contravention 
of the provisions of the Act, with imprisonment for a term which may extend to 
three months, or with fine which may extend to five thousand rupees, or with 
both. Section 41 of the said Act provides for the penalties for contravention of the 
provisions of the rules. These penalties have not been increased since the year 
1960. The Government of India has enhanced the punishment of similar offences 
under the Ancient Monuments and Archaeological Sites and Remains Act, 1958 
(24 of 1958), in the year 2010. To make stringent punishments for violations 
of the provision of the said Act it is proposed to enhance the punishment for 
imprisonment upto two years or fine upto one lakh rupees. It is also proposed 
to enhance the penalties for violation of the provisions of the Rules. 

3.  To maintain the sanctity of the forts and ancient monuments, it is also 
proposed to make penal provision for doing any obscene activity or gambling, 
or consuming or possessing liquor or other intoxicant substance, within the 
premises of the forts or ancient monuments. It is, therefore, proposed to make 
amendments in sections 33 and 41 of the said Act, suitably. 

4.  As both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session and the 
Governor of Maharashtra is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it 
necessary for him to take immediate action to amend the Maharashtra Ancient 
Monuments and Archaeological Sites and Remains Act, 1960, for the purposes 
aforesaid, this Ordinance is promulgated.

Mumbai,	 C. P. RADHAKRISHNAN,

Dated the 14th October 2024.	 Governor of Maharashtra. 

	 By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra, 

	

		  VIKAS KHARAGE,

	 Additional Chief Secretary to Government. 

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,  
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,  
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,  
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


